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current and accurately updated throughout the semester by the 
organization or group, and it shall be conclusively presumed that 
the officers or members whose names are on the list most 
recently filed by the organization or group are authorized to 
speak for and represent the organization or group in its relations 
with the Component and are authorized to receive for the 
organization or group official notices, directives, or information 
from the Component.   

 
6.42 Except for national honor societies which require outside 

members, no registered student organization or group may have 
any person as an active member who is not either a student or a 
member of the faculty or staff of the Component.  Except 
pursuant to the provisions of Chapter VII, Subsection 3.4, no 
organization or group, whether registered or not, may use any 
facility of any Component of the System if it has as an active 
member any person who is not either a student or a member of 
the faculty or staff of the Component.   

 
6.43 Any Component funds that are expended on behalf of student 

organizations will be maintained by the Component.  Both the 
advisor of the organization and the designated officer of the 
organization must authorize any expenditures from the 
organization's account.  All university funds (such as those 
generated by student service fees) expended for the benefit of 
student organizations must be expended from budgeted 
Component accounts. 

 
6.44 All Component-provided funds of registered student 

organizations are subject to audit by the Component.  Failure to 
maintain adequate records may be considered in determining 
whether a student organization may maintain its registered status. 

 
6.45 Student organizations, their officers, and sponsors are responsible 

for assuring that they comply with all applicable Texas State 
University System, State, and Federal Rules and Regulations, 
including tax code compliance. 

 
6.46 Each Component may develop applicable policies and procedures 

to promote fiscal integrity and accountability for student 
organizations. 
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